Berneslai Homes - Freedom of Information 2024-2025: IT

585	26/04/2024	Q. Please could I have the following information provided to me please, about software which
		may be procured by the council. I have checked the contract register and unfortunately the
		information I need is not listed.
		Housing Register / Choice Based Lettings software
		1). What was the start date of the contract?
		01/04/21
		2). What is the duration of the contract including any extensions?
		31/03/2028
		3). When does the contract formally expire (before any extension period)?
		Review Date 30/09/2025
		4). Who is the senior officer (outside of procurement) responsible for this contract?
		Berneslai Homes IT Manager
		Homelessness Case Management software
		1). What was the start date of the contract?
		23/03/2024
		2). What is the duration of the contract including any extensions?
		12 Months
		3). When does the contract formally expire (before any extension period)?
		23/03/2025
		4). Who is the senior officer (outside of procurement) responsible for this contract?
		Barnsley Council Service Director – Communities

586	14/05/2024	N.B. We advise that as an Arms Length Management Organisation most of Berneslai Homes' procurement and IT is handled by Barnsley Metropolitan Borough Council (BMBC), therefore we do not hold much of the data requested. In instances where data is not held by Berneslai Homes we have marked the section with "BMBC".		
		Q1. Can you please list the number of devices deployed by your organisation for the following?		
		Device Type	Number of Devices	
		Desktop PCs	2	
		Laptops	400	
		Mobile Phones	502	
		Printers	BMBC	
		Multi Functional Devices (MFDs)	ВМВС	
		Tablets	377	
		Physical Servers	BMBC	

Storage Devices (for example: NAS, SAN)

Networking Infrastructure (for example: Switches, Routers, Interfaces, Wireless

Security Infrastructure (for example:

Firewalls, Intrusion Detection Systems (IDS),

Access Points)

Virus Monitoring Tools)

BMBC

BMBC

BMBC

Berneslai Homes - Freedom of Information 2024-2025: IT

Q2. Does your organisation plan to procure any of the below enterprise applications or software, if yes, please provide information in the below format. Please note, if the applications you're planning to procure are not listed below then do mention them separately.	2024/25 Spend/Budget (£000)
Content Management System	Not yet decided
Supply Chain Management (SCM)	Not yet decided
Inventory Management Software	Not yet decided
Enterprise Asset Management (EAM) Software	Not yet decided
Business Intelligence Systems	Not yet decided
Other software/apps (mention the name of the software)	Not yet decided
Q3. Do you have any plans to procure End user devices (desktop/laptop/tablet/mobile phones etc)? if yes, please provide information in the below format.	2024/25 Spend/Budget (£000)
Desktop	No
Laptop	No
Mobile Phones	Yes
Tablets and Others (if Others, please specify)	No
Q4. Do you have any plans to procure below services/softwares? if yes, please provide information in the below format.	2024/25 Spend/Budget (£000)
Artificial Intelligence (AI)	Not yet decided
Cyber Security	Not yet decided

Under the Freedom of Information Act, I am requesting detailed information regarding your organisations Access Control System. The information from your request is exempt under Section 31(1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. Sharing the data requested would prejudice Berneslai Homes in the prevention of crime, because knowledge of our systems could cause vulnerabilities to the organisation in relation to cybercrime and hacking. Berneslai Homes are responsible for the management of the Access Control Systems installed on the Councils housing stock. We have a Service Level Agreement with Barnsley Council (Barnsley Property Services) for the provision of repairs and maintenance, mechanical and electrical engineering works for commercial building services.